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To Whom lt May Concern,

I am delighted to write this letter of recommendation for Balpreet Singh, who worked as a co-op student
software developer at Motorola Solutions during the summer-2024 term. Balpreet's primary focus was on
automated software testing development, and I am pleased to highlight his exceptional qualities and
contributions during his short time with us.

Balpreet proved to be an incredibly quick learner, consistently demonstrating a remarkable ability to grasp
new concepts and technologies with ease. His aptitude for understanding complex software testing
methodologies and toofs was truly impressive. This allowed him to make significant contributions to the
development of our automated testing framework, and his innovative ideas greatly improved our testing
processes.

Beyond his technical skills, Balpreet's personal integration with the rest of the team was outstanding. He
effortlessly built strong relationships with his colleagues, contributing to a positive and collaborative work
environment. Balpreet actively engaged in team discussions, sharing his insights and suggestions to
enhance the overall effìciency and effectiveness of our projects. His exceptional communication skills and
ability to work well with diverse personalities greatly benefited our team dynamics.

Balpreet consistently delivered work of the highest quality, making him a dependable and valuable
member of our team. His attention to detail and meticulous approach to software testing ensured that our
products were thoroughly evaluated and met the highest standards. Balpreet's ability to identify and
resolve complex issues within the software was parlicularly noteworthy, and his contributions significantly
enhanced the reliability and performance of our deliverables.

ln summary, I highly recommend Balpreet Singh for any future opportunities in the field of software
development. His exceptional technical skills, quick learning ability, and strong interpersonal skills make
him an invaluable asset to any organization. Balpreet's consistent dedication to producing high-quality
work and his ability to contribute effectively to team objectives make him an outstanding candidate.

Please feel free to contact me should you require any additional information or have further inquiries
about Balpreet's qualifications. I am confident that Balpreet will continue to excel in his career and
contribute positively to any organization fortunate enough to have him on board.

Sincerely,

Don Matheson

Sr. Manager - VESTA Radio Test & Technical Services

Motorola Solutions Canada lnc.
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